
1 

‘04-4e41-- - 50 s 

c . 	 aw../F. it. 89u 

vits.tintttosett° 41•0-4 1 

McfMcC cr?'/Z aRIV-47 1:7 

I 
9M737 7/T7,9  

TT ght7 ZTtrilin7t1411 srwthin 

97rWNPal.  
.4. I. "Ir. 

it 4dt4-pz 
mirg (w) 

r ga-f9-f1/24ii 
tr 

MI;tir, IEMTTI 1 qlcRT,..2000 

1-7: .10, 1922 qTT Kinfl 

WIT 	ti (111( 

NE7141-  9:TTIIT- 

EtV1M 2 4 szikprz,-fu-i--1 (W) -3 2- 20 00 

Ms(4, 1 Tdrir, 2000 
••••••mamde.....  

1ZF5H1991i2  

frfEr11 

411 tifiarqn arrifg 200 rt filaghtif Trutmrcrtr-047r 4 een Crk4 fvj Rotp. 
Im 	4tfku Brit /14ST eZT1cfn TT, - (ft erg #111619') 10447 2  2000 In: finttr 31 inEy, 2000 
111131-6 aTff Tel R.11 411 z57T SPIV 21itfiffr(IT litsu1 35 131: 2 000 ) 	qk ErEiltrtutql cr 
‘ti eifiTTEMT gt7T 11Rillkia• fivErt qlfft 

3W7..Stivr MICR Vs, (Pei.  lOntrff) 011194ff, 2000 
(3,en srtir vrfrf4u; 4-avi is 9 2000) I. 

NITT IWZ Sri NEMc 	ru tuft? gait; 
131el:K Rtkr StillTt EFT rlikt., 1 948 MT V.IfUT 4111t'd 47T4 

;419fiqff 

lum 'Prom! c4inzra 40 Fitrafwa fetrf4zrq2fRim mr a :- 
1 --I:7 gir#413 . 	Sth! Milne .E0T (ft.4trr 44110-ff affETNTIrr: 2 000 

cingsr1 

2 -CO 

rp 

t? Ttc 



2 	 1M7:SINT WIETTV4 Ertit, 1 881-87, 2000 

2-897 Sibt E8T4Tt rot ..ef?..-; 1 948 t, nE14 974 Tro,ff '40.1887/ TeffiT ENT 
ti 	3-T4 :— 

(;) Team (I) 4 eruz- (a), (TO, (4-1), (ti); 	(s) 

	

threffilerff eroeig fi4 rq4, 	:- 
1' (9) W37 (ETT) # fereTe Irre.  It f4a 4liT 	4rie 4 fe*e 

ET8 Eft, T-14 EEfF 4t 9;t1T 48111srfeTra 	arefst* 	trt F:44 V88 
n*Tt, faFrfkr era:, Eitferd qj, 911171T ',31TRIT1 er< f981-fETW Eflu* 
it4ET Tr filer-14w T4441 ettz P4w-few 	TitTri4r 41-  et 44--a1 t I 

	

('T) rn (47) lii erue (er) 	fecere Trim 	Paw Trrff * 
qatIETij 185E8 88 78 f88t5T zu EflEffaEre 8ITT 180 k Tea' 
Risen 	n It *Mar ,wierrr I" 

(a) errata (2) k ever f4Teferikte urrettr 8ft a qt7Trr, 
4e14, 

Vex siker t4e 
atevrt is 
91 1948 WI' 
Eft-if 	4TT 
44T1ET8 EETT8 

ci 

1 , 

9T7T 4 EFT 
derlEte 

&IV 4-'8( WI 
4,4144 • 

• 

"(a) *0 reTr nr*TT It tilevr 	ft fe: firth TEro Trr 
rAff eft f* f'tIrq cc$1414 Ten re gm 44-  ect 	3efElitf (11 

*ttlre (9), TM (TT); tgET (ET-1), Tgfa8 (8) trT 8(07 (W); vim 
f* 	u9-4.: etre Terart MT (10%7 titTET8) 91Eff-888;  2000 k sTrTni *31* gi feerar4 	k Trite 4e-,914 f*Trr zirTr 41T qt. 
Tileurr irTr sta-T4 cr-K sr5e- 	tIt rrzTsr* creme, ifi•# t rir *i 
cgr4; ;111e.1.41, 	8e8 fE0 34 um:45e.  EfT f8;81-588' *t f8Eff 
9TET I" 

.3-8;9 era/fee-4 *1 tint 4 4, TIITNIKTEI aaTe (a) * TerkTcr. fere, 
fafwe 	Ty? feet wyrr, aerie :— 

" ( 	) t It fTenTe le• 91.787, jr ?TT 81Cf8 -07-.1 	nit f*ze- gra gqfkittha. zit q9fEcrlism rit qatlf9 FTEIE7,ii¢? fif89ETT ET rf1887 
EfT it* t.  91I49 84ff k;'• 

Tff9f888 ift &ITT 4 48 4 wo4r7r. (2),* 41-arq f4T4f4F43 - 
849173 	ith rrtft, 	 

arki 8-E8 EFT 
Terela4 

%Ira 32 vET' 
#811.89 

"( 2-8C) Tqf r441 faTirftra.  Tera k Figa It err Witt * vele ettt . 
erg Tamarsrerur-Tra 997 srt8 Rf1tTrt Efft OWN fl) E8) CEff888; 2000 

srf 8swf 	Aro a  5,ft, gin., 	f,wew gry 44r 419 187fTflff 14181 0717 	• 
ty 11* friwfkr *fe4fts * we' * 14-iitb 4 SOTO) FVfT 	t 	era 

ffile ITTE-88T ezirrestra. 	qet fesrfra 	&14- 1184TrES 4 Wu- 
TOTEr 8ETFTT 91-48T I " 

5-19 Effaf884 * Ertl 8-4! it,— 

. 	(*) ticrEutt (1 ) It,mg (q) 
erre '!el- et 44-4" ti M 91q41 

(9) 9€08121 (1-*) 4,— 

(efEE) 908 (eE) 	349118 .(e) It, srleatirreTr* an It 
t.,4%-qnre..eTrit" k T414 47 9E8 ormee-  set" ma lea erqr; 

(it) aue (a) It crEe ',trete-  Ticia",• "Efrottf 87ii" qtr.< 
"trine eir ewe 	FtEf T8 Eit 1*Efl/T: 9E7 "7Er 41 se-4", 0441-Freak" 
er1T "ew 	T.Tre" 	9Tr.fe 

affithETTI 0 EMT 32 it, 7871-0 ( 1) * t!fT9.  crt 18z9f.1.446  
qjrr 8r1-. 	oteliq 

( I ) ?"t" (a) * 7cr4741 a-414 	 site afrfft 
vz (fete tersr4) Trfelezrzr, 2000 * 51TKEIT k feet* *1 ETT 81T* 

. 81179 rT: Tre eq.  elflike-Tr * 4914 at c WT4-78.1TE 97-8 sureirrwrir 
- 47 ezr TO* fe-Tefelke Ozrri elk_ Eet-regiv4, arifeTe er ape Tritarfzrt 

51g "qir 	ret" tElf8 eft 

9E8 



?Mv. nein 	1117c1 482, 1 T4 7,77., 20 00 

fro k•er srft 1 nistIgall-uo• 7fTw.  yr 0, 4 gr<ru 	pt. ur TRAM, Tru 	: 

) URI" 9 k artilu witti 
417-77 crir 

(7) WTI 1 o k 4414 ar4)EW 
* stru-ua u? 

fn-struucu 	Itit..16 	'.4•4'IT4 tt897.151 
471.  ttt uftistal f*r1 ffur 	EFutflqm 
sftz arth 	nirstur gur igIC 8117 I 
14-qinirfa TT, Tile78 4T ffrAlCarg 	antrrit 
tat 411 ura uf4116 	q74' 4 Ertu utu 

ulz 4figur 4 wrier, Uri' 1qT't 
Nti41 

4'418 rwr t (7) ErtV.  35.k :tutu nril-ur-
rra uz 

N) Iktul 	SfW4i-crw gray—. 

	

(1 ) 	qsqrqR 657 	4111" Z:t4t•I 
ft1W47.zrg4'62a4r 

4fuquit sir arierwzur 
t.zw-11497 

(2) u•fasift 	arilaVtii a •actan, 
Trt gifIqrU er 
zri.ulfuu 

7-4v3lfETFffzrrr 4 4414 aq4P fiffiff tt4flie I 	
9N4t 
fka wnr 

	

8—( 13 rwarPtz 44zrr 95 imi0fir0-2-2 89frurzz-9 (820 )i 92-30 40 	fietuziff rat 'fa 0-15-.48-RIkffe- 99; (k4t4T 12 rfitit, 1 999 	alift tif "REIM 	zisitnru 

	

s.turtue, I 999 	'eri7ff rit We' 4111: 	"ft-9u 1 arEtt, 1997 #" 
We wife 	frk wit ire qzret wale' t 

( 2) 148ft3 4941 01(01-40- 2 -1 1728ITO tt-9 ( 34)198-3040 31520- 
1 8 -48 -arik41-.98, fkutzr 30 7,81t, 1 998 	so: arti aibb qtriff 1 QM% 
1999 4" it zira orKvr aitz zrat "NqtatI arsiF, 1 gg5 ,4" Vif 1W 

ur7,* re Trir Rite quiff t 

mrir 
tit& Trq 

7%14 Tif9'4' 

No. 2462 (2)/XVII-V4-1 (KA)-32-2000 

f:Dated Lueknaw, November I, 2000 
1t4 pursuance or the provisions of clause (3) or Article 348 of the Constitution 

of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English 
translation of the Uttar Pradesh .  Vyapar Kar (Dwitiya Saashodhan) Adbiniyam, 2000 
(Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Saathya 35 or 2030) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature 
and assented to by the Covernbr on October 31, 2000. 

THE UTTAR pRADESH TRADE TAX (SECOND AMENiDNIENT) 
ACT, 2000 

e 	(U. P. ACT $0. 35 oF 2000) 
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature] 

AN 
ACT 

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Trade Tax Act, 194g. 

It IS HEREBY enacted 
as follows : 

in the Filly-tst Year of the Republic of India 

nett title I. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Trade Tax (Seednd 
Amendment) Act, 2000. 



Amendment of 
I 	 section 3-A of 
r 	 U. P. Act no. 15 

I 	
of 1948 

i 

Amcniment of 
section 4 

II 

4 
	 797., WT Ettetr(ct trez, 1 ee'reee, 2000 

2. In section 3-A of the Uttar Pradesh Trade Tax Act, 1948, here-

inafter referred to as the principal Act, 
in sub-section (i) for clauses (b), (c), (e-l), (d) and (e) the 

following clauses shall be substituted, namely:—
on the turnover in respect of goods, other than the 

good S referred to in clause (a), at such point and at such rate, 
not e 'weeding fifty per cent, as the State Government may, by 
notification, declare, and different points and different rates may 
be declared in respect of different goods. 

(e) on the turnover in respect of goods, other than those 
referred to in clause (a) or clause (b), at the point of sale by 
manufactmer or importer at the rate of ten per cent." 

(b) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be 
inserted, namely 

"(3) Where the State Government has declared any point or 
rate at which the tax payable by a dealer under the Act be levied 
under clause (b), clause (e), clause (c-/), clause (d) or clause (e) of 

sub-section (1) as it existed immediately before the commencement 
of the Uttar Pradesh Trade Tax (Second Amendment) Act, 2000 
and such declaration is in force on such commencement, such rate 
or. point of tax shall continue to be in force after such commence- 
ment, until modified or rescinded." 

• 
3. 	In section 4 of the principal Act, in the explanation. for clause 

(b) the following clause shall be substituted, namely 

"(b) Milk includes reconstituted or recombined milk prepared from 
slammed milk powder, butter or butter oil but does not include condensed 
milk, powder or baby milk;"ri 

Amendment 01 	4. In section 4-B of the principal Act, after sub-section (2) the 

seeTion 443 	following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :— 
"(2-A) Where ar.y recognition certificate isseed under this section 

in respect of any notified goods is in force on the commencement of 
the Uttar Pradesh Trade Tax (Second Amendthent) Act, 2000 and the 
notification by which such goods has been notified is made effective 
from a date prior to the date of such notification, the recognition 
certificate in respect of such goods sball be deemed to be valid with 
effect from the date such notification has been made effective." 

5. 	In section 8-A of the principal Act,— 

(a) in sub-section (1), in clause (d) for the words "one hundred 
rupees" the words "two hundred rupees" shall be substituted; 

(10 in 5n b-SectiOn -Ab— 

(1) 	in clause (a), in sub-clause (ii), in the proviso for the 
words "twenty five rupees" the words "fifty rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

(10 	in clause (b)• for the words "fifty rupees", ',twenty five 

rupees'
. 
 and "eve hundred rupees" the words "one hundred 

rupees". • "fifty rupees" and "one thousand rupees" shall 
respectively be substituted. 

6- In section 32 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1) the 

following sub-section shall be eubstituted,namely:— 

“(1)  Subject to he provisions of sub-section (3). the fee payable 
on a memorandum of appeal or other application. under this Act filed 
or moved on or after the data of the commencement of the Uttar 
Pradesh Trade Tax (Second Amendment) Act,. 2000. whether the 
assessment, penalty or other proceedings giving rise to such appeal or  
.application were initiated before or after such commencement, shall 
be as follows:— 
(a) on a memorandum 	Two per cent of the amount of tax, fee or 

of appeal under 	penalty in dispute, subject to a minimum 
section 9. 	 of one hundred rupees and a a:0E4MM of 

one thousand rupees. 

A mendmect of 
section S-A 

Amendment of 
[section 32 



Vit sthr rraraitir fl, 1 Wt, 2000 5 

(b) On a Memorandum 
of appeal under 
section I 0 

even and half per cent of the amount of 
tax, fee or penalty in dispute, subject to a 
minimum of five hundred rupees and a 
maximtm of ten thousand rupees, 

Fifty rupees On an application 
under section 35 

On auy ether 
application, - 

(1) When addressed 
to the 
Commissioner 
or the Revising 
Authority or the 
Tribunal; 

(ii) When addressed 
to any other 
officer 	or 
authority. 

Twenty rupees 

Ten rupees 

The Schedule appended to the principal Act shall be omitted. 

(1) In notification no. T.I.F.-2-289/X1-9(820)-92-U. P. Act-15-48-
Order-99, dated February 17, 1999 for the words and fieures "from 
February 15, 1999" the woris and figures "from October 1, 1997" shall 
be substituted and be deemed always to have been substituted. 

(2) In notification no. T. I F.-2-1728/X1-9(34)-98-H. P. Act-15-48-
Order-98, dated July 30, 1998 for the words and figures "from August 1, 
1998" the words and figures "from April I, 1995" shall be substituted 
and be deemed always to have been substituted. 

omission of the 
Schedule 

Araudment of 
notifications 

By order, 
Y. R. TRIPATHI, 

Pramukh Such iv. 

ito 	rrlo cha—,qo to 155 MO fERTO-.- (2329--2000-830 (No) I 


	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005

